
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 14-14031
 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Contruction Equipment

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 2, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

3 ea. *

Four-Wheel Drive, Rubber tire articulated loader (4-cubic yard), complete UNIT PRICE 180,000.00 199,520.48 217,262.62 222,648.71

per specifications TOTAL 540,000.00 598,561.44 651,787.86 667,946.13 NO BID

A. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2011 Ford F750 Case 821F John Deere 644K Int'l 4400

  *   

1 ea. UNIT PRICE  140,539.40 152,280.90

Crawler Dozer, complete, per specifications TOTAL NO BID 140,539.40 152,280.90 NO BID NO BID

B. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL  Case 1150M John Deere 700K   

1 ea.  *

Tractor, Four-Wheel-Drive with ROPS/FOPS canopy, front-mounted extendible UNIT PRICE 65,800.00 86,201.32 72,936.18 75,600.00

backhoe, (platform type) complete, per specifications TOTAL 65,800.00 86,201.32 72,936.18 NO BID 75,600.00

C. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL JCB 3CXSuper Case 580SN John Deere 310K New Holland B95C

Net Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Item A - 150 days Item A - 120 days

Item B - 200 days Item B - 120 days

Delivery Days 90 days Item C - 130 days Item C - 90 days 120 days

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

ASCO Equipment Kinloch Equipment & Supply Demandstar

Equipment Depot RDO Equipment SAWS Website

Freightliner of SA Rush Truck Center SA

Grande Truck Santex Truck Center

JCB of South TX Vermeer Equipment of TX

Kenworth French Ellison Truck Center Waukesha-Pearce Industries
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